



State of South Dakota

Bureau of  
Information &  
Telecommunications

Request for Bid Number 3307  
05/21/2018

Randy Sullivan, Purchasing Agent  
[randy.sullivan@state.sd.us](mailto:randy.sullivan@state.sd.us)  
Telephone: (605) 677-6416

| Line | Qt  | Item                                                                                         | TESSCO | Show Me Cables                                   | Graybar     | Wholesale Electronics | Comtrad Cable |
|------|-----|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------|--------------------------------------------------|-------------|-----------------------|---------------|
| 1    | 50  | PANDUIT CMFIG MINICOM F-TYPE MODULE (UPC # CMFIG)                                            | 3.95   | 1.66                                             | <b>3.66</b> | 6.93                  | No Bid        |
| 2    | 50  | PANDUIT CFP4SY FACEPLATE; STAINLESS STEEL; 4 PLEX (UPC # CFP4SY)                             | 7.50   | 2.45                                             | <b>6.89</b> | 12.99                 | No Bid        |
| 3    | 30  | PANDUIT CFP6SY FACEPLATE; STAINLESS STEEL; 6 PLEX (UPC # CFP6SY)                             | 7.50   | 2.45                                             | <b>6.89</b> | 12.99                 | No Bid        |
| 4    | 100 | PANDUIT CMBIG FACEPLATE BLANK; GREY (UPC # CMBIG)                                            | .22    | .3                                               | <b>.21</b>  | .38                   | No Bid        |
| 5    | 100 | QUIKTRON 560-130-007 NETWORK CABLE; CAT5E; NON-BOOTED; RJ45/RJ45; RED; 7 FT (UPC # CAT5-7-R) | 1.35   | 1.38                                             | <b>1.26</b> | No bid                | 1.13          |
|      |     |                                                                                              |        | *Gave quotes on Substitutes—We are unable to use |             |                       |               |