



State of South Dakota

Bureau of
Information &
Telecommunications

Request for Bid Number 3308
08/08/2018

Randy Sullivan, Purchasing Agent
randy.sullivan@state.sd.us
Telephone: (605) 677-6416

Line	Qt	Item	SHI	B&H	CDW-G	MNJ TECHNOLOGY	SWEET WATER
1	100	LENCO 1098Q or equal DVD CASE; TRIPLE SLIM; 14MM; DARK GRAY; LITERATURE TABS; FULL OUTER SLEEVE FOR INSERT; DOUBLE DISC TRAY THAT CAN HOLD ONE DISC ON THE FRONT AND ANOTHER DISC ON THE BACK (OVERLAY TYPES ARE NOT ACCEPTIBLE); AMARAY # 3851	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	6	PRIMERA 53601 or equal INK CARTRIDGE FOR DVD/CD PRINTER; CYAN	22.81	24.04	29.31	25.50	No Bid
3	20	VERBATIM 95079 or equal DVD-R; 4.7GB; 16X; DATALIFEPLUS; WHITE INKJET PRINTABLE HUB; PRINTABLE NO STACK RING	12.47	12.42	17.00	13.95	No Bid
4	4	PRIMERA 53602 or equal INK CARTRIDGE FOR DVD/CD PRINTER; MAGENTA	22.81	24.04	29.31	25.50	No Bid
5	4	PRIMERA 53603 or equal INK CARTRIDGE FOR DVD/CD PRINTER; YELLOW	22.81	24.04	29.31	25.50	No Bid
6	8	USB DRIVE; 8GB	6.79	6.31	6.00	5.15	8.79
7	2	VERBATIM 95355 or equal DVD-R; ULTRALIFE ARCHIVAL; 4.7 GB; 8X	82.61	78.26	102.61	78.00	No Bid
8	2	VERBATIM 98319 or equal DVD+R-DL; 8.5 GB; 2.4X; DATALIFEPLUS; WHITE INKJET PRINTABLE	53.73	54.02	71.41	59.25	No Bid

--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--