



State of South Dakota

Bureau of
Information &
Telecommunications

**Request for Bid Number 3309
09/07/2018**

Randy Sullivan, Purchasing Agent
randy.sullivan@state.sd.us
Telephone: (605) 677-6416

Line	Qt	Item	COMTRAD CABLE	GRAYBAR	WHOLESALE ELECTRONICS	SHOW ME CABLES
1	10	FIBER CABLE; 50/125 MULTIMODE FIBER OPTIC OM3 DUPLEX LC-LC PATCH CABLE; AQUA; 1 METER	7.60	5.73	11.20	9.99
2	10	FIBER CABLE; 50/125 MULTIMODE FIBER OPTIC OM3 DUPLEX LC-LC PATCH CABLE; AQUA; 3 METERS	8.30	7.33	13.43	11.99
3	10	FIBER CABLE; 50/125 MULTIMODE FIBER OPTIC OM3 DUPLEX LC-LC PATCH CABLE; AQUA; 5 METER	9.50	8.93	15.67	13.99
4	18	FIBER CABLE; MTP FEMALE TO 8 LC UPC, 8 FIBER QSFP MULTIMODE OM3 50/125 BREAKOUT CABLE; AQUA; 3 METERS	95.00	98.80	205.34	NO BID
5	6	FIBER CABLE; MTP FEMALE TO 12 LC UPC, 12 FIBER SINGLEMODE OS2 9/125 BREAKOUT CABLE; YELLOW; 3 METERS	105.00	106.84	295.00	100.99 (5 m)
6	24	LEVITON 5F100-4LL or equal PLATE; SDX PRECISION MOLDED; BLUE; SINGLE-MODE; OS1/2; QUAD LC; 24 FIBERS; ZIRCONIA CERAMIC SLEEVE	NO BID	90.61	371.00	NO BID
7	3	LEVITON 5R2UH-S06 or equal CABLE CABINET; 2U; FIBER	NO BID	275.34	999.00	NO BID

