



**State of South Dakota**

Bureau of  
Information &  
Telecommunications

**Request for Bid Number 3343  
07/23/2019**

Randy Sullivan, Purchasing Agent  
[randy.sullivan@state.sd.us](mailto:randy.sullivan@state.sd.us)  
Telephone: (605) 677-6416

Line	Qt	Item	TESSCO	GRAYBAR
1	17	NEWMAR BDP-2 / 75A or equal SWITCH PANEL; 48VDC; 75 AMP	<b>2901.39</b>	3394.22
2	250	WAYTEK WB4-2 or equal CABLE; RED; PVC; COPPER; BATTERY CABLE; 4 GUAGE	NO BID	<b>236.70</b>
3	250	WAYTEK WB4-2 or equal CABLE; RED; PVC; COPPER; BATTERY CABLE; 4 GUAGE	NO BID	<b>236.70</b>
4	250	WAYTEK WB4-0 or equal CABLE; BLACK; PVC; COPPER BATTERY CABLE; 4 GUAGE	NO BID	<b>236.70</b>
5	250	WAYTEK WB4-0 or equal CABLE; BLACK; PVC; COPPER BATTERY CABLE; 4 GUAGE	NO BID	<b>236.70</b>
6	10	HAINES PRODUCTS HLC456 or equal COPPER LUG; 4GA; 5/16 STUD; TESSCO PN 367407	<b>67.60</b>	81.00
7	10	HAINES PRODUCTS HLC438 or equal COPPER LUG; 4GA; 3/8 STUD; TESSCO PN 327833	<b>76.00</b>	91.00
8	5	HAINES PRODUCTS HLC414 or equal COPPER LUG; 4GA; 1/4 STUD; TESSCO PN 357606	<b>40.20</b>	48.15
9	6	HARGER HLHDWPK14 or equal BOLT KIT; 1/4 X 3/4 STAINLESS STEEL; TESSCO PN 471683	<b>15.78</b>	24.06
10	6	HARGER HLHDWPK38 or equal BOLT KIT; 3/8 X 1 STAINLESS STEEL; TESSCO PN 441626	<b>29.22</b>	45.84